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Ventura River Steelhead Survey

Spring. t995

Abstract

A sampling survey was underlak.en 01 selected reaches of the Ventura RIVer to oblatn
information on current steelheadlralnbow !tout populations In the Ventura River
system, Ventura County.

Those reaches which remall) acceSSible to adult steelhead migrating upslream 110m
the ocean, and which currently prOVide OOlentlslly suitable spawning and fearing
habitat, Include the Ventura River flam the Robles Diversion downstream to the
Ventura River Estuary. No sampling was done on Coyote Creek, or In the Venlura
River Estuary. Sampling on San AntoniO Creek was limited to a single poot located
0.25 mile above the confluence with the Venlura River.

The survey initially exlended from April 18 through April 30, and was subsequently
extended through May 27. 1995. A total 01 52 rainbow trout were captured. and 48
released durmg thiS ellorl. All fish were captured from SIX disjunct reaches 01 the main
slem 01 the Ventura RIVer totaling 4,25 mites

Inlormation was Obtained on the presence and condillon of fish Scales samples were
oblained Irom t 7 specimens. and fin tissue samples from 9 specimens for genetic
analysis. The number of fish captured generally decreased from upstream to
downstream river sectIOns. The fish captured during the survey may be derived from
anadromous fiSh, resident nallve or non· native fish, or hatchery fish stocked Within the
Ventura River syslem, e,ther In tributaries, 01 two major reservoirs.

Introduction

Sleelheadlrainbow trout populations In the Ventura Rivel system (See Figure 1.) have
not been well studied. (Chubb, 1997: Moore, 1980a, 19800)

Prior to the sharp decline In steelhead populallon size following the construction of
MaliliJa Dam in 1948, InvestigaHons in the Ventura River wele limited to occasional
stream checks to determine general habitat conditions (e,g" stream flow, water
temperature, presence or absence of vegetative cover. sedlmenlation. etc.) and creel
censuses by the California Deparlment of Fish and Game (Moore, 1980a; Swift, 1993;
Titus, et aI., 1995). Moore (198Gb) Investigated the reallng habitat chalBCte,isllcs and
growlh/mortality rales of an experimental population of juvenile steelhead Slacked
from the Mad River Hatchery into the main Slem of the Ventura River, bUI made no
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assessmenl of natural recruitment or run size. A live year river survey by the Casitas
Municipal Water Dislrict and the City 01 San Buenaventura relied on visual
observalions to survey fish popula\lOns. <Ind did not employ any standard sampling
techniques such as weir traps, Iyke nets, seines. or electrofishing. (Casitas Municipal
Water District. at al.. -1984: City 01 San Buenavantura. at aL t990. 1991)

Tha purpose of lha current survey was to ascertain the presence or absence of
steelheadlrainbow trout (Oncorhynchus mykiss) In the Ventura River and its tributaries
which remain accessible to anadromous fish, and to collect scale and tissue samples
10 generate information on the life history and genetic characteristics of O. mykiss in
the Ventura River

No atlempl was made to determine population denSity, diSlribu\lOn, or movement of
fish within the river system, though rnformation prOVided on the catch per unit effort
may permit an estimate of the relative density of fishes between river seclions
sampled. (Bagenal, 1978; Gunderson, 1993)

Methods

Collection permits were obtarned from the California Department of Fish and Gama to
collect steelheadlrainbow trout (Oncorhynchus mykiss} from selected reaches of tM
Ventura River system, Ventura County (See Figure 2,)

Approximately 5 75 miles {37%1 at the 16 mile length 01 the maIO stem at the Ventura
River was surveyed for O. myklss. Fish populations were sampled by angling with
light tackle and artificial lures. Lures consisted of small spinners (with NO.1 or 2
blades) with an artificial lIy tied on a No. 12 or 10 barbless hook. Small lead shot was
used to weight the spinners to allow angling near the oouom of pools and deep riffles.
Most sampling ottons wora conductod durong thc Qvenings, although sevoral sampling
efforts were made dUring the momrng hours.

Several river seClrons wrticn nave histOrically nave contained O. mylfiss when water
conditions are favorable were surveyed from 1 to 4 times. A total or 17 sampling efforts
were made during the study pellOd, tctaling 31 hours. Sampling periods ranged from
0.5 to 7 hours. with a majorlly of effons being 1.5 hours in duration.

Because of the Shortness of the survey period and the amount of water to be covered.
sampling efforts were concentrated On selected reaches of the main slem of the
Ventura River where the likelihood of encounterrng O. mykiss was believed to be
greatest, I.e., deep pools, glides. and larger riffle areas. These stream habitat types
constituted less than 20% at Ihe rrver length from which sampling efforts were made.
(See Appendix A: Ventura Arver SteelheadffroUl Habitats.)

No sampling efforts were made In Coyote Creek. and sampling on San Antonio Creek
was limited to one ellort in a single pool located 0.25 mile above the confluence with
the Ventura River. No sampling etlorts were made in the Ventura River Estuary which
extends 0.5 miles upstream from the Ventura River mouth.
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Tabla 1 ProVideS a breakdown of Ihe sampling effort per river section.

Table 1: Ventura River SteelMead Sampling Sections/Etfort

River Seclio"":--'L~,"~go.'"h------cN''oO.<S''"CNC;;;''' Tolal Hours

"
'"

0.75 mJlc SOClion o)(lon!llog do....nWllllffl ..~
tile Robles O"'tlIBlOrl

015 mile sllCUO<1 el<'lencllng from Lr.a oak
O\ll:lk d!;rwrlS\l8llln 10 San AnloolO Crock

o IS Mlk! soctton ClXIMdlng 'JP:Strl!~m trl)01 FOSIe<
Paok 81idQe

,

,

3.5

'.0

'"
O.l~ mile $0I;ll0n extondlnQ trom Fos.lar Park 3
Br~ 00wnsl'6lIIl1!OO\al Va/k!y Sarotary DISIrIC;l
Wa51ewamf Tre:l!tTl6fll Fac~.y

1 ?5 mla S8C1i(Hl I:lxt...l(Ii,9lr<m Caf\acl.;IlJIrll'l Crock 4
downstream to Sh(lII Road Bfi(lge

, S rniI$ S$CIlOIl el(\lll~ong t.PSlte.rn ll'om the U S
HogIfway I 0 I Bri<lQ<l

"

"

'"
70

The reach of Coyote Creek between the base of CaSitas Dam and us confluence wllh
the Ventura RIVer Is c. 2 miles ~ length. This reach of Coyote Creek has been highly
modified as a resun 01 the construction and operation of CaSitas Dam, which has
reduced base flows and elimmated annuaillushing flows, This altered flow regime has
lead to encroachment 01 the stream channel by nparian vegetatIon, and heavy
accumulation of slltatlon In the channel bed. The likelihood was low that thiS stream
sectIOn {except tor the stilling CUJn at the base of the Casitas Dam spillway) held
steelhead or resident rainbow trout.

San AntonIO Creek has a year round surface flow, and IS the only steeJhead spawning
tributary which remains accessible to adu~ steelhead migrating upstream from the
ocean. The small summer base flow and relatively few deep holes 0111'115 stream,
combined With elevated algal levels (due In part to urban and agricUltural nutrient
sources) and elevated summer base flow water temperatures (due in parI to modified
riparian vegelatlve cover) limits. but does not preclude utilization by steelhead or
resident rainbow Irout.

Sampling effons were conduCt90 from April 25 through May 20. With one additional
etfort on May 27, Ihe opening day of the regular lrout season. (Additionally. an
electroflshlng effort was conducted on two SectiOns of the lower Ventura River by the
California Department of Fish and Game Wild Trout Crew Oil June 27, 1995.)
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Aller caPture, Iish were examined lor indicallons of ongln or life history (halchery,
stream, or ocean residence). If a Ilsh appeared to be of non-hatchery origin (by silver
coloration, absence of lin erosion, and response to hooking). scale samples were
taken above Ihe lateral line, and a I cm2 sample 01 tissue was faken from the lower lip
of the caudal fin Scales from 11'10 specimens that appeared to be of hatchery origin
were also collecled for comparison With non-hatchery IIsh sampled during the survey.
Scale and fin tissue samples were not teken from all fish sampled, either because the
IIsh escaped before scale or fin tissue samples could be collected, or because of Ihe
tlkely mortality from further handling (See AppendIX F SleelheadlTrout Data Survey
Reports)

Scales were plaCed in IndlVldu!ll. labeled manila el'lvelopes. Scale samples from 17
specimens were dry-mounled on glass slides and transmilled 10 Ihe Inland Fisheries
DiviSIOn, California Department of Fish and Game, lor future analySIS, (See Appendix
G: SteelheadITrout Scale Vouchers,)

Tissue samples were temporarily preserved in indiVidual labeled Zip-lock plaStIC bags
or metal loll. All lissue samples were subseQuently transferred to IndIVidual, labeled
plastic vlElls and lefrlgerated at ()<l F Tissue samples were lransferred to Ihe Hoplllns
Manne Stalion where mltochondnal DNA (mlDNA) was extracted from lin clips USing
Chelex-l00 reSin 'allowing melhods given by Nielsen. et al, (1994b). For mtDNA
amplification speCific primers werl'! used WhICh were known 10 amplify a highly
variable segmenl 01 the mlDNA COnlrol region in sslmonids, Double and single­
stranded amplificalions were performed us,ng Polymerase Chain Reaction (PCA).
The smgle-Slranded product was sequenced and the DNA was visualized accordrng to
melhods given by Nielsen, et a!. (19940) A(ldilionally. ampllficatlon 01 alleles at ten
mlCrosatelll!e loci (One/d4, Ssn85, Otsl, One)J1I, Sfo8, Omy77, One/12, SS314,
Omy325, and One/IB) were performed on the nine samples, however, several
microsatellite loci did 1'101 amplify for all 01 the fish, most likely due 10 Ihe degraded
condilion of some of the matenals

Photographs were lalc.en of representative fish from which ellher scale and/or fin tissue
samples were laken, All fish were released (or Inadvertently escaped) back into lhe
stream, with the excepliOn of two hatchery fish Which were killed during capture. (See
Appendix C. Steelheac!fTrout Samples.)

Results

OncorhynchUS mykiss were captured from six disjunct seclions of the Venlura River
10laling 4.25 miles in lenglh, or appro)({mately 27% of the lotallenglh 01 lhe main stem
of Ihe river. (See figure 2.)

A 10lal ot 48 specimens of O. mykiss were caplured durrng the survey periOd, Irom April
251hrough May 20_ An adollional4 fish were collected on May 27, the opening day of
Ihe regular troUl season. Rsh were captured as far up-stream as the Robles Diversion
(14 miles upstream of the mouth) and as far downstream as the Shell Road &Idge (2.5
miles above lhe mouth). (See AppendiX D; Steelheadffroul Sample Location Maps.)
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The fish ranged in total length from 19 cm (7,5 in), to 39,5 cm (16 in), and averaged 25
cm (9.75 in). A majority of the fish captured appeared to be female. although sell was
not formally del8fmined (See FIgure 3.)

Of the 52 fish captured. l!\Ie appeared to be of hatchery origin. The remaining 47 fish
appeared to be 01 native or non-hatchery origin (I.e.. progeny of either resident or
anadromous fish) Non·hatchery lish were characterized oy a complete complement
of non-erodod lins, Silver coloration (In severallnSlances loose scales), and a vigorous
and acrobatic resPonse to being hooked Several ot tM non-hatchery fish exhibiled
smolt characteristics (I e.. bright silver coloration and loose scales). Hatchery fish had
severely eroded dorsal andlor caudal fins (m one case missing pecloral fins), and a
sluggish response to being Make<!.

SCale samples were taken from 17 Irn:tlvidusls. Of these, fin tiSSue samples were
laken from 9 individuals. llssue samples were laken only from fish not having viSible
hatchery characteristics (Le" what appear90 to be native reSident or anadlomous fish)
as stipulated in the California Deoanmenl of Fish and Game SCientifiC sampling permit
protocol. (Calltornia Department 01 Fish and Game, (995) In addition, scala samples
were taken from Iwo hatchery fish whicn were killed dunng capture for comparison
wrlh natr-hatchery fish. (See Appendix G, Sleelheadrrrout SCale Vouchers)

Table 2 provides a breakdown 01 fish caplured by river section and catch per unit
effort 01 lime.

Table 2. Ventura RIVer Steelhead Samoling Sections/Results

River Section lenglh Tota! Hours No Fish Ash/Hour

0.75 mile scctlOO ellfendlng downslfNm from " " 5."
Ih<.l Robles DIversion.

" 0.75 mile sooioo clilandlllg trom UWI Oak " " "Craek (lowl18trearn 10 San AIl1Ol11O Cr~

'"
0.75 mile soctioo ellflmdlng llfl!'lfr.am from lhe FO:Sler '" n "ParkBr~

o 75 mile sectIon exIencllng 110m FOSler Park , 0 , .IS
BIt1ge OOWJl&lI&81T110 Ojai Valley SarlIIafY DtSll'l;!
WastOWala' Tr&allTler1l Faclity·

v , 25~ sectJOll 8Jl!eI'lCl'!lg wem Canada Larga Croo/< ,,, 6 ...l<
oowretream 10 Shell Road 6riOge

1 5 mile section ellfendiflQ l!(I81feam !remll1l:l US. 7.0 .0
HigtfWay 101 BriOge

'The ,eIalMily small runber 01 jish colleded !remltJ;s D.75 mile sllClioo mliy bEl due 10 the~. rKXllber 0(

lavoraUle hatMtals umpIod (2 pools aM one run I.
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The number 01 hSh captured generally decreased from upstream to downstream
sections. with the highest density of fIsh encountered in the reach of river immediately
downstream Irom the Robles Diversion. and in the vicinity oltha FoSler Park DiverSion.
(See Figure 2.). No fish were encountered or captured In Ihe 1.5 mile seclion of the
river extending upstream from the U.S. Highway 101 Bridge (Iocaled 0.5 miles above
the mouth Of the river at the Pacific Ocean). However, in a subsequent electrofishing
survey conducted by Ihe California Department 01 Fish and Game Wild TrOut Crew on
June 27, 1995. one indlvk!ual O. mykiss was collected c. 1.5 miles above the U.S.
lOt Highway Bridge. (See Appendix C SteelheadlTrout Samples. FIQures 23 and
24.)

All scale samples have beun deposited With and curated by Donms McEwan, Inland
Asheries DiViSion 01 Ihe California Department of Fish and Game Samples Will be
analyzed for lile history (fiver. ocean, and estuary) and growth panorns by Department
personnel or persons under contract to Ihe Dep,)rtmenl. and the results presented in a
separale reporl. (See AppendiX G SleelheadlTrout Scale Vouchors.)

All lin tissue samples have been depOsited with and curaled by Jennifer Nielsen at the
Hopkins Manne Stalion, Stanford Umversity. The resu~s of the mtDNA sOQuencing
revealed IMI a majority ollhe Iish sampled were of the mtDNA type 3. Hapk)type 3 is
mOle common on central and northern California steelheed populations, though this
type also occurs in southern populations Will less frequency The small sample size
(nine) was, however, nOI sulf,clent 10 draw any conclUSions about the relative
frequency of mtDNA types on lhe Venlura River syslem (See Figure 4.) The results of
lhe microS<ltellile analYSIS was consistent Wllh prevIous stUdies of salmonid
genotypes, wilh Significant genetIC frElQuency differences among three biogeographic
zones In California' northern, from Humboldt Bay to Gualela Point; central, from the
Russian Rivel to Pomt Sur; southern, trom San Simeon Point to Santa Monica Bay.
(Nielsen, 1996; Nielsen, 1994; Nielsen, et at, 1996. 1995, I 994a, 1994b, I 993a,
1993b) (See AppendiX H' Ventura RIVer mtDNA HaplolypeS and Nuclear Microsatellite
Loci)

Table 3 presems the resulls of tne mitochOndrial sequencing ror the mtDNA control
region of nine fish sample<:! during the survey,

Tab'e 3: Ventura RIVer Salmonld Haplotypes

"RC,i,".~,'S~.;;et"'iOOo'----'SpeCimenNo, FiSh Lengthlcm mlDNA Haplotype

I
I
I
I

"•III
IV
V

3
38
13
48
28
18
26
22
17

19
23
23.5
26
26
23
26
28
33

3
3
3
3
5
3
3
3
1
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Discussion

Current Habitat CondilJons

Above average ralnlall durmg the 1994-95 raintaU season generaled favorable water
condllkms in lhe Ventura Arvel and tributaries for resident or anadromous fish The
gauging stallon al MaliliJa Dam on MatiliJa Creek. the principal lnoutary 10 the Ventura
River. reported 55.56 inches of rain between October I. 1994 and May 30,1995,
representing a 100% increase over the long term annual average of 26.92 inches
reported from thiS gauge site Similarly, Ihe gauge located atlha Oak View County
Fire Slation near the middle reaches 01 the Ventura RIVer, reported 42.27 Inches of
rain between October I, 1994 and May 30. t995, also representtng a 100% Increase
over lhe long term annual aversoe 01 22 28 inches reported from this g3uge site.
(Casitas MuniCipal Water DistrICt, I 995a, 1995b. arld 1995c: Ventura Counly Flood
Control DiSlricl. 1995a: U.S Army Corps 01 Engineers, 1971. 1973) (See AppendIX E:
Ventura Rrver Hydrologic Condlllons)

Above avelage ramfat! totals resulted in relatively high sustained flows through the
survey period, Peak flows measured at the gauging station below the Foster Parll.
Bridge (which records flow 10 the ocean) reached 51,000 cubIC feet per second (ets)
on January 10, 1995, and 3<1,000 cts on March 10 1995 Flows to the ocean during
lhe Sludy periOd did not drop oelow 85 cis. As a result, there was contJnuous flow from
lhe headwaters of the Ventura AlVer (conlluence 01 Matllija Creek and the North Fork
of the Ventura Aiverlto the ocean from the lirst week In January 1995 Ihrough the end
of tha survey period. (The mouth of tha rlVar was open prior 10 the January storms and
thare was a continuous flow In the lower 8 mllas of the fiver since mid-November.)
(Casitas Municipal Water District, 1995<l, 1995a, 1995f. al'ld 1995g: Ventura County
Flood Control DIStrict, I 995a, 1995b, and 1995c; U.S. GeolOgIcal Service, 1995)

These conditions provided surtece !lows adequate to allOw both upstream migration of
adult steelhead from the ocaan. as well as downstream emigration 01 Juvenile fish
(both offspflng of anadromous fish as well as native and non-native resident fish) to
lhe ocean as smo~s.

Habital conditions varied between the SIX river seCllons: these are brieMy described
below

Rivel SectIOn I: Robles Diversion to Highway 150

This river sectiOn consisled principally of a series of pools and glides through a
boulder field, with linle or no riparian covel. Habrtal structure was provided by rock or
boulder cover, and relativaly deep pools and glides. The section proaueed the largest
number of fish sampled par unit of time effort (See Appendix A: Ventura River
SteelheadITrout Habitats, Figures I and 2.)

RIVer SacllOn It Live Oak Creek to San Anlonio Creek

1



This river section included some of tne mosl diVerse habitats, with pollioos 0' the fiver
running through deep pools, shallow riffle series, undercut banks, and along well
dovolopad multl·storied riparian vegetation, Fish were encounteled primarily in deep
pools and riffles. (See Appendl~ A· Ventura RIVer SteelheadfTrout Habitats, AgUfes 3
alld 4.)

River Section III: Fosler Park: Bridge Uostream

This rIVer secllon contained a selles of pools deep riffles. an(! shallow glides The
habitats were bordered by riparian cover. prinCipally a varlely of Willow (Salix $p.) but
wl\h some Sycamore (Platanus racemosa) and Cottor'lwood (Populus Iricf!ocarpa) on
one bank:. and a gravel or cobble bar Or'l the opposite bank. Pools bordered by over­
hanging riparian vegetation prOVided the largest number of fish. w,th dt!t!per riffles
also hold'ng fish (See Appendilt A. Ventura River SteelheadfTroul Habitals. Figures 5
and 6.)

RIVer SeCllon IV Foster Park Bridge to Ojel Valley Sanitary District

The river section contaIned relatIVely few pools, and only shallow glides or riffles. The
majority at Ine lisn were sampled tram Or'le large pool cut up agamst a elevated river
terrace. with only moderale rlpanan cover on one b,lnk (See Appendilt A: Vontura
River SteelheadITrout Habdals. Figures 7 and 8.)

River SectIOn V, Canada Larga Creek to Shell Road Bridge

The river seclion contained a number of lalge and deep pools and glides against
undel'cul banks. and Ine largest pool m the rIVer sections surveyed (Shell Hole).
Riparian vegetation was present along most of the river s&Ctlon. but absent on one
bank or with the other bank bordered by a large gravel or cobble bar. Fish were
generally confined to pools with over-hanging riparian vegetation and WIth a small fall
or riffle at their upper end. (See Appendllt A: Ventura RiVer SteelheadfTroul Habitats.
Figures 9 and 10; cover photograph)

River Seclion VI' U.S. Highway 10t Bridge Upstream

The river section contained a large number of large glides ana: pools. and riffles. and
has the most e~tensively developed nparlan canopy. consisting pnncipally of a variety
of Willow (SaliX sp.) and some Collonwood (Populus triChOcafpa), and Sycamore
(Platanus racemose) rntermllted. As noted below, the river section had the most
heaVIly sedlmenled channel bottom, ana produced the rewest Ush. Appendix A:
Vemura RIVer SteelheadfTroul Habitats. Figures 11 and 12.)

Origin of Populations

RainbOW trout were seen or captured in all river sections surveyed. except the lower
1.5 mHesof the Ventura River between the Shell Road Bridge and lhe U.S. 101 bridge.
(However. one Individual O. mykiss was collected c 1.5 miles above the U.S. 101
Highway Bridge in a subsequent eleclrofishing survey by the California Department of
Fish and Oame Wild Trout Crew on June 27.1995.) Mos: of the fish captured during

,



thIS study (47 of 52 or 90%) appeared to be non·hatCtlery rish (I.e., had been spawned
and reared in tha Ventura RlVer. ellher as progeny or anadromous or resident rish),
based upon external morphologiC characteristICs (colorstlon. condition of rins, loose
scales) and behilvior (vigor In attackmg the lure. acrobatic response to beIng hooked).

The followIng provides a discussion or the possible origins or the rainbow troul
collected during the survey by river section surveyed

RIVer SectIOn I: Robles Diversion to Highway 150

ApprOXimately 36% of Iish tak.en during this survey were captured In a 075 mite
section at Ihe main stem 01 the Ventura River extending downstream rrom the Robles
Diversion This section or the fiver is frequently dewatered as a result of diversions by
the Robles DiverSIOn to the Casllas Reservoir. and the naturally high percolation rate
at surface Hows 10 the shallow grounawater table. It 1$ unlikely that the flsh caplured rn
thIS section were spawned and reared In this section or the Ventura River because of
the annual dewatering These I,sh were most likely derived Irom IIsh poputations in
the main stem Of the Ventula RlVer above the Robles Drverslon, or in the headwaters
01 the Ventura River. either Malilija Creek (and liS tributaries) or the North Fork of the
Ventura River.

There are approximately 275 miles of year-round sleelheadlttout habitat in the main
stem of the Ventura Alver above the Robles DIVerSIOn, and an additional I 25 miles of
year-round steelheadltrou! h<lbltat In Matihja Creek below Mallhja Dam. The actual
amount of habllal fluctuates annually with stream flow conditions These stream
sections SlJpporl a heterogeneous rainbow trout population conSIsting 01 resident IIsh.
hatchery fish stoc~ed In the headwaters 01 the Ventura RIVer, and possibly. remnant
land-locked sleelhead. (Carpanzano, 1966. Cardanas. personal communication)

AbOve Matilija Dam lhere are approximately 15 miles of steelheadltrout habltal In the
main stem or Matilija Creek. as well as 7 miles in the Upper North For1l 01 Malillia
Creek, and 5 miles in Munena Creek The actual amount or habitat fluctuates annually'
with stream flow conditions Mat,1118 Creek and tributaries above Matilija Dam have a
heterogeneous salmonid p(lpulation consisting 01 nalurally spawned resident rainbow
trout, Slacked hatchery IISh, and possibly land-locked sfeelhead. These fish would
have an opportunity to pass Irom upstream sections downstream when water is
spilling over Matillja dam. (Carpanzano. 1996; Chubb. 1997: Moore, 1980a)

Matilija Dam was constructed In 1948 wilh an anginal storage capacity of c. 7,000 acre
feet. The reservOir has experienced a 90% reduction in slorage capacity as a resu~ of
siltation and lowenng of the dam. As a resurt. MatiliJa Dam spills annually. During the
1995 ralnlall season, Matllija Dam spilled continuously from January 9 through May
30, 1995, with average dally spills ranging from 100 cIs to 5,580 cIs. (Catilornia
Department of Water Resources. 1988; Casitas Municipal Water District. 19951'1:
Ventura County FlOOd Control DistrICt, 1975)

Fish emlgraUnQ Of Involuntanly moved downstream by high flows in Matifija Creek
above the Malilija Dam would drop 140 fOOl over the spillway of the dam. The vertical
drop over Metilija Dam can adversely al!ectthe survival of fish in two ways: (1) direct



physical Impact by falling Into a SIaliC pool of water and (2) exposure to super·
saturation of gases which can result in gas bubble disease and mortality. The physicat
impact on fish passing over the dam IS delermlned by the terminal velocity of the Iish
which is a function of the size of the flsh and Ihe extent to which the fish is entrarned In
the falling water stream Exposure to super-saturation of gases (primarily nitrogen)
depends upon the volume of flow and the depth to which the falling water stream
penetrates the plunge pool at the base at the dam (HeIse. personal communIcation)

No studies h3ve been conducted on mortalrty rates of fish passing over Malilija Dam.
and. consequently. il is not known what percentage of fish moving over the dam would
survrve in the fall, thovgh some Injury or mortality can be expected. (Heise, personal
communIcation: Clay. 1995)

The NOlth Fork of the Ventura RIVer (also known as the North Fork of Malitlja Creek)
has apprOlO:imately \0 miles of perennial ralnlxlw troUt habitat. The North Fori<. has 3
heterogeneous raInbow trout populallon consisting 0' stocked hatchery fish. nalurally
spawned reSIdent rainbow vout. and posslb'y remnant land-locked steelhe3d
(Moora, 1980a) These !Ish would have an opportunity to pass downstream when water
is flowing through the by-pass gates of the Robles Diversion. The by-pass gates ate
abullad by a concrete spillway approlO:!mately 10 teet In height. with a slope of c. t5°.
(Cramer. et al. 1995: Moore, 1960a. 1960b, WlCkstrum. personal communication)

River SeCtIOn Ii: Live Oak Creek !O San AntonIO Creek

Twenty-five percent of the hsh laken during this survey were captured in 3 0.75 milo
section of Ihe ma'n slem ollhe Ventura RIver elO:tend,ng from LJve Oak Crook 10 San
AnlonlQ Creek. Only the lower ponions 01 thiS reach maintams surface flow in aver3ge
waler years. although the amounl of !low can vary conSiderably dependIng on
seasonal rainfall The area, however. has histOrically been used by adult sleelhead
ml9rating up from Ihe ocean to spawn. and contains suitable year-rOUIld habitat
during wet years

Rainbow trout collected from thiS seChon could have been derived from anadromous
or resident rainbow troul populattons in the Ventura River below Ihe Robles Diversion,
resident rainbow trout (natIVe or introduced) populalions rn the Ventura River system
above the Robles DiverSIon. or slacked halchery fish that washed down from stocking
sites in the Ventura Aiver system above the Robles DiverSion

River Sacllon iiI: Foster Park BrIdge Upstream

Approximately 21% of the fish taken during this survey were captured in a 0.75 mile
section 01 the maIn stem of the Ventura River e~tending upstream from the Foster Park
Bridge. This area histOrically has contained year·round trout habilat because of the
surface flows from San Antonio Creek and a shallow rISing grourn::!water lable.
Portions, hOwever. are periodically dewalered as a result of both ground and surface
water extraClioflS by Ihe City 01 San Buenaventura.

Rainbow trout collected from thIS sectren could have been derived from anadromous
or residenl rainbow lrout populations In the Ventura Rrver below the Robles DIverSiOn,
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residenl rainbow lroul (native or IfItroduced) populatiOns In the Ventura River system
above the Robles Diversion, or stocked hatchery fish that washed down from stocking
sites in Ihe Venlufa RIVer system above the Robles Diversion.

Additionally. Ihe lower sectIOn of thiS reach 01 the Ventura River is periodically [ed by
Coyole Creek and Santa Ana Creek. both Of whitn are blocked by Casitas Dam.
Coyote Cleek above Casitas Dam has a heterogeneous rainbow trout population
consisting of natlHaiiy spawned reSident fish. and possibty remnant land-locked
steelhead. Additionally some hatchery fish stocked in Casitas Reservoir may ascend
Coyote and Santa Ana Creek 10 spawn All 01 these fish would have an oppOflunity \0
pass from upstream S9(:tions downstream when waler Is spllling over the cresl of tha
Casitas dam spillway (Moore. 1980a).

Casitas Reservoir was completed In 1958 and has a storage capacity of c 250.000
acre feel, The storage capacity has remained relatively unchanged since ,Is
constrUC/lon because ot the d,vars,on or water with low sill levels via the Robles
Diversion on the main stem of lhe Ventura River. As a resu~, Cas~as Dam sPills only
Irregularly. Since Its construction Casitas Dam has spilled seven times: 19n1. 19BO,
1983,1986,1991,1993, and 1995. During the 1994-1995 rainy season, Casitas
spilled conllnuously from January 25 through the end of May, With flows ranging trom
c. 3 cfs to c. 747 cfs. (Cahlorn,a Department of Water Resources, 1966: Casitas
Municipal Water District, 1995e)

Fish emlgratJng or Involuntarily moved downstream WIth high flows )n Coyote and
Santa Ana Creeks above CasITas Dam could pass over the spillway 01 the dam which
Is 285 reet high The Spillway has a slope of only c 150 It is possible that a
significant percentage 01 lIsh moving over the spIllway would survIVe because of the
relatively shallow gradienl 01 the spillway shool. However, It is not likely that large
numbers of juvenile trout in the tributary streams would pass through the lake and over
the spillway since there is no current to provide stimulus or gUidance through the
reservoir. Nallve resident and planted reSident troUI in Ihe lal<e near the spillway.
however, would have a greater chance than fish in the tributaries to pass o....er the
spillway and contribute to the steelheadltrout population downstream. (Cardenas,
personal communication; Clay, 1995)

Two of the five stocked lish believed to be 01 hatchery ongln collected during this
SUf'Vey were taken within 0.5 mile downstream ot the confluenCe of Coyote Creek and
Ihe Ventura River, and may have been derived from the hatchery population in Casitas
Reservoir, or from hatchery fish stock9d In the North Fork of the Ventura River. (See
Appendix C: SteelheadlTrout Collections, Figures i8 and 20,)

River section IV: Foster Park Bridge to Ojal Valley Sanitary District

Approximately 6% of the fish taken during thIS survey were captured In a 0.75 mile
section of Ihe main stem of the Ventura RIver extending rrom the Foster Park Bridge
downstream to the Ojai Valley SaOliary District.

This reach historically has maintained year-round trout habitat as a result of the
contribution 01 surtace flows from the Casitas Springs reach, a shallow rising
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groundwater lable. and more recently, lrealed wastewater discharge (1.4 million
gallons per day) Irom the Ojai Valley Sanitary Dislrk;t

In addition to instream recru,tment. IISh collected in thIs reach dUring the survey could
have originated Irom anadromous lish, or from resident or slocked fish in lhe main
$Iem 01lh8 Ventura River in the CaSItas Spring reach, as well as abOve the ROl)les
DIVersion, in the main Slem or headwaters of the Venlura River (either from Maliliia
Creek or lhe North Fork of tile Venlura RIVer).

This reach 01 lhe Ventura R,ver is also fed by Coyole Creek and Santa Ana Creek.
both of which are blocked by the Caslta5 Dam. but may ostiodIcally receive fish during
the spillage waler from Casilas Dam.

River SectIon V Canada Larga Creek 10 Shell Road Bridge

AppfOltlmalely 12% 01 the fish taken dunng this survey were captured In a 1.25 mIle
section of the maIn stem of the Ventura RIVer exlencling from Ihe conlluence 01 Canada
Larga Creek 10 the Shell Road Budge

ThiS reach hlslorlcally has maintained yesr-round trout habital as a result of Ihe
contrrbullon 01 surface flows from Ihe Casllas Springs reach. a shallow groundwater
table, Canada Larga Creek inflows, and more recenlly, trealed weS1ewater discharge
(1.4 million gallons per day) from the O/al Valley Sanltafy DlSlrict.

tn addl\lon 10 instream recrullment, flSIl collected In this reach during lhe survey could
have orJgJl1a19d from anadromous flsh, or been derived from resident or stocked fish In
the maIO slem of tha 'Ventura Aiver In the Casitas Spring reach, as well as above tha
Robles DIVerSIon, or 111 Ihe headwaters 01 me Ventura River. either from Malltija Croek
Of Ihe Nonh Fork 01 the Ventura Rrvel.

This reach of the Ventura Arver is also led by Coyote Creek and Sanla Ana Cr&ek,
both ot which ara blocked by the Casllas Dam, but may penodlcally receive fish as a
result of water spillage over Casitas Dam.

River Section VI: U.S. Highway tOl Bridge Upstream

No O. mykiss were collecled or encountered in Ihe \.5 mile section of the Ventura
Aiver extending from Ihe Shell Road Bridge downstream to lhe U.S. 101 Bridge.
(However, one individual O. myltiss was collected c, 1.5 miles above the U.S. 101
Highway Bridge in a subsequent etectrcfishing survey by the California Depanment 01
Fish and Game Wild Trout Crew on June 27,1995.) This sectIOn of the river sustains
year-round surface Hows supplied by the sources noted above, and during the survey
period exhlbiled habitat conditions comparable, and In some respects superior
(because 01 better developed riparian cover), to the habitat in the section upstream
batween lhe Shell Road Bridge and the confluence of San Antonio Craek with Ihe
'Ventura River. (See Appendix A: SleelheadlTrout Habitats. Figures_ 11 and 12.)

Two faclors. however, may adversely affecltha current suitability of this reach 01 river
for steelhead! Irout, even durrng periods of high flows: {ll high levelS of nutrients and
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other pollutanls, both from POint ana non-pont sources. and (2) the high degree 01
sedimentalion of the channel bottom Nutnents and other contaminants in wastewater
discharged !rom Ihe Djai Val ey Sanitary District Treatment Plant have contributed to
(educed wa\tu quality (Including lowered dissolved oxygen levels and turbidity),
Addilionally.there Is a senes 01 storm drains along Ihe tower 2.6 miles of the Ventura
River which contribute to pollution loading on the VanlulB Alvar. Increased nutrienl
levels lIlereaSEl algae production and rasuilin dJUrnallluctuations or dissol>Jed oxygen.
Thick mals of algae growth covered river cobble and sediment deposits in the largo
pools "nd runs throughout the lower t.5 miles 01 the survey area. (Ojai Valley
Sanitary District, 1991) (See Appendix E Ventura River Hydrologic COnditiOns.)

Finally. the low gradient 01 this portion or the Ventura River allows the deposlllOn or
fine sediments (silts and muds) from adjacent agricullural. oil. and reSidential
developments. Fine sedtments can reduce benthiC food production. as well as
facililate the encr09chment of aqualJc vegetation which can reduce liVIng space lor
resident or an9dromous fish.

Summary and Conclusion

Above average rainfall during lhe 1994·1995 rainfall season produced flow conditions
conducive 10 anadromous and residenl trout utllizaltOn throughOut the Ventura River
sySlem, from its headwaters to lhe moulh al the Pacrlic Ocean A total of 52 rainbow
trout were captured by hook and line somphng in Sl~ diSjunct section of the Ventura
niver rrom April 25 through May 27, 1995 The fish ranged in size from 19 em to 39.5
cm and av~raged 25 cm The denSity and number of fiS/'l captured generally
decreased Irom upslleam to downstream river sections

A majorrty of Ihe lish sampled during thiS survey appeared to be of non·hatchery origin
(based on smolting characteristics) rather than of hatchery origin (based on fish
erosion and other characteristiCS). but could have been derived from either
anadromous or native reSident fish. While lhe origin and life histories of the
specimens collected during thiS survey could not be definitely determined, there are
four possibill1ies lor the Origins ofthase fish'

(1) progeny of anadromous fish:

(2J progeny of reSident native- or non·natlVe rainbow lrout populations In
tributaries 01 the Ventura River system Including tributaries to Casilas
Reservoir (I e, Coyote and Sarna Ana Creeks),

(3) stocked hatchery fish in tne main stem or the headwaters of the Ventura
River (I.e., Matilija Creek and the North Fork):

{4) stocked hatchery IIsh from the two major reservoirs In the Ventura River
dralnaQe (I.e" Casitas Reservoir. and Matil~a Reservoir).

A comparison with the genetlcs of fish collected from upstream areas, Inclu(Mg
Coyote and Santa Ana Creeks. and Matilija Creek and the North Fork of Ihe Vernum
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River may be useful In elucidating the nature of the sleelheadltrout populations In the
Ventura River sysTem. The analysis of IhlJ scale and lin tissue samples collected as
part of lhis survey may prOVide addlllonal msight Into origins, population structure, and
lile histories of the sleelheadltrout popu1alions In lhe Ventura River
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Apperldlx A

Vonlura River Steelhel:ldfTroul Habitats
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Appendix B

Ventura Riller Major Waler Supply FacIlities
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VenhHiI River StoelhoadfTrout Samples
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eo!orallon, no r:n
8rO!JI0fl S~men
No. "3.



Fig. J. Ventura
River c 025
fIllltl tltllow tI,O
Roblus Dlvo~lon,

looking nOrlhwtl~1

upstreum. May
20. 1995 NOte
tIoulder litHO a,Kl
lack 01 ov<:r
t1itngJng ,Ipafian
v.wlOn
AVtlrugo dally lIow
c 73 cis

Fig. 4.
Onoolhynchus
myklss colleCted
trorn lllll venwra
RivClr c. 0,25
mile tlelow the
Robles Diversion.
May 20, 1995
l811gttl: 23 em (9
In.) Nota DrllIhl
silver coioriitlon,
lose scales atIovtI
lateral line, no lin
orosloll.
SpecllTl9Il No. 36.



fig. 5.
VlIl1lura R1V(lf c.
0.1.5 mile OCIOW
",R_
Drvllf$lon. looking
notthwesl
upslf9aln May
20, 1995 Long
pool between 3
and 516el de!lp

N«o-. ""'"
Vld IIlck or ow.­
"3f9lQ npan.,-­AV(lflIge~ flow
c 13 Cb

Fig. 6.

"""''''"'''''m:r*Iss eoIlectea
trom \tle Ve.nI\.JriI
Riv. C 0 75
~ l)elo", 1M
F1otJ1M DtYelSlon
May 20. 1995
Lengm: 19 em
(7.5 In.) NCll:e
bright silv8I
color'lllon. loose
~ near ca,O;rd
fin. no fin
eFOSJOf/.

Specimen NO 33.



Filii. 7.
Venlurill River c
o 7S mile aboVlI
lhe co"nutlOOll 01
San AnIonio
Creell.. lOOIling
nOl1l1wlISI
upslrll<m ill easI
brlloc:ll M"y 16.
1995 Notll pool
In IowIlr lell c.
!eel deep AverllOll
dad., now c_6C

"".

Fig. S.

"""'"""""nry/l:l$$ <:oIledecl
hom Ihe VCIlIUf.l
AMlr c 0.75
f'llIllI abo'IlI IhII
_d....
NllonoO e'Mk
MillY 19. 1995
lllngm 211 em
(1075 In) NOIe
bll<Jfl1 sllvllr
cOiorarion. no lin
"'O$Ion
SpeamenNo28



Fig. 9. VcnlllrA.
River c. 025
r"de atlovc ~s

(:onlluOnoco willi
Sail MlOlI,O
Creek. 10000mg
WO$! upslream (II

easl Chartrlel May
19. 1995. Nolc
pool ran()OO Irom
2 10 " Je61 cteeo.
AVflr3'IC darly 1kwI
c 73 cis

Fig. 10.
OfJCOfhyncllll~'

mylcJss collOC1M
from Ihe Ven1ura
RIver c, 0.25
mile MOve
confluence 01 San
I\ntor1l0 Crl:lllk.
May 16, 1995.
length 23 cm (9
in.). NOIII
plcoomlnil.ntly
silver coloralion
WIth rO$e noo 011
~ side, no fln
erosion
Specimen No. 19



Fig. 11.
Venllll"il RivQl' C
o 75 II1lles abu'ro
lhe FoslCf P,lrk
Bridge. looking
nOflh upslfearn
May la, 1995
R;f~e fllftgeo IfOm
:2 10 J leef aeep.
Avernge dally Ilow
C 88 cfJ:.

F19. 12.
Oncotnyn<:hus
myk/s$ coIectoo
!rom lhe Ven.ufiI
River C. 075
mill! above .he
Fosler Park
Bridge May Ie.
1995 Lengtn: 26
em (10 In). NDl:e
silver colOl'auOfl.
lose $Cales aboVe
laleral line. 110 lin
&1"09'011.
Specimen No. 26



Fig. 13.
Ventura River
o 75 mHe IDovU
lIle Fosler Par\(
Srldoe. 1000hlQ
nOrllleast
upstlcam. May
18. 1995 Pool
ranged btHween I
104 lce1~_
Average dally Ilow
C 103 cIs.

Fig. 14.

0''''''''''''''"'mykiss coIlecled
trom me vcnmra
River 0.75 mile
aboYe I~e Fosler
Park Brklge.
April 26. 1995.
Lenglll; 26.5 cm
(10.5 In.)
NOie Silver ,,"gad
W1\h blue hue
<Ibove and below
lateral line no fin
erosion
Specimen No I 1.



Fig. 16.
""""""",.
myluu c:oIIcled
"om 1~1l VenlllrOi
RIver 200 yards
below tile City 01
San OuDniIvemura
F er Parle.""...ON'ers.on. M.ily
18. lt9S
Lel'llllh 28 C'II
(12 In.l NOle
slr.er colorallon
no fin llIOIoion
~Imen No. 22.

Fig. 15.
Velllur Oi Rl'lcr
200 yarda belOw
lhI CIty ol San......."""".
FOIl. Pari<
Su,laee
OfVerslOR I0oI<'09
ROflhea51
upwearn 011 !!<lSI
CnaMeI May 18
'tiS Long gil."",
ranyed hom 2 10.""'­Ayeraoe d3lly lIow
c 100. CIS.



Fig. 17.
Ventura River c.
0.25 mil\! b\!IOW
th6 Foster Park
Brldge. looking
northweSl
upSllellm June
5. 1995. Note
FOSler Park
Bridge In C(lnll)'
ba<:kg.ound.
Average d3Jly 1I0w
C. 84 cIs.

Fig. 18.
Oncomync.nu.~

myk/ss collecled
Irom lh\! Ventura
River c. 0,25
mile below Ine
FOS1\!r Par1<.
Bridge. April 30,
1995. Length: 36
em (14 in). Not\!
silver coloration
aoove and below
la16ral line,
erosion or dorsal
and caudal fin,
Spec"nen No. 14.



Fig. 19.
Ventura nlver c
0.25 mile billow
1M Fostcr Park
Bridl/tl. looklllll
norlhwllSl
up$lrcllm J'lne
S, 1995 Nola
SIlIiIlS ot ri"lll:<;
and glk!os, FOSIor
Park BrId\l6 In

Ctlnltlf

back\lrOlJnd
Average da,ly flow
C 84 cIs

Fig. 20.
Oncorhynctlus
mykJss eollecteo
trom the Vanlvra
River c. 0.25
miles below lhe
FOSlel PaJ'k
Bridge, Apr11 26,
1995. LeogtI1 26
elll (10 In,). Nole
silver COIOl'aliOll,
eroded dorsal lin
Ql'l(\ t.JPPer calida!
lin.
Specimen No. 12



FIg. 21.
Vcnlula R1Yer
o25 m,1e abo¥1I
ltltl Shlltl Ro.llI
8rIdge:, IooIclng
nQl1hwesl
upSlrllam May
18. 1995 LonO
glide rllfl96d 1I(lI'h
310 4S feel deep
"Yllfa96 daily flOw
C 103 cis

FIg. 22.
()oKxJrhrncnUS
mylrlss CQllecled
Irom lhtl VtlmUfa
AIYllr 0.25 milll
aboYC the Snell
AoaO Bridge May
18, 1995.
LCngttl; 33 em
'13,n·l. NOli
blllih1 silYtl
coIofaIion, 10M:
,.;:ales ne... caudal
II:!. Sl:lil'll eroslOtl
OIlOtoer caudal
lin
Spel;nen No 11,



Fig. 23.
Calif Delll. ul FlllI'
am Giwnc WlIo1
Trout Crew
e19Clfofishmy
Ventura fllv(!l" C
1.5 mll03 abOve
the Inooill. IooIIRlQ
nOl1hwcM
upstream JUIltl
27. 1995
Ayorage (lanv I\I1W
c, 60 cIs

Fig. 24.
Onwrllyncf'Uli
myl<l.~$ eollcc'er1
Irom rhe Ven1ura
R,VIIr e. 1.5 rn~!Is

<Jb<We trl() mOUln.
by Calif Dept. of
Fish anU Gallle
Wild Trout Craw.
Juno 27, 1995
Length: 27 em
(11.5 In.), Note
silvor coloration
billow lateral line.

""""" """'" "'"lower caooal lin.



Appendill 0

Vcn1ura RIver SteelheadlTroul Sample Location Maps
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Appendix E

Ventura River Hydrologic Conditions
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Appendix F

Ventura River SleelheadfTroul 0313 Survey Reports



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEBLHBAD DATA REPORT

REPORTI~G nmIVIDiJAL SUrle>' J. C411l!l;i STREAl'l fISHED \'enll,lra River

ADDRESS 121 ralonares ' ...ert..e. ~enl... ra. cr. nCOJ OA7E ~~ril 25. \995

(80S) 65'·C£51l'liU;-"!> ~v. UNLY UNA UA'A ANU UNA AN~~&K ~&K UAIA ~n&&1

STATION DATA STREAM DATA FISa DATA

"" TiME HABITA": WATF.R TOrN, S''''IPLF. COHMEN"l'S
NO. LOC>.7l0N' STAAT STOP TYPEl rEM? ' TURBIDITY' LV-NOHI' TAKEN', ~~t tu Q a 6:00 po, 8: 00 pili (j11 ell' · Clear 21 (;,11 II I ~ii~h~, silv:r. no p~, ~.,

~\'~ _~o~ 6:00 pT. 8:0C pn (j lIdt · C1 Cd r 20 em II I ~\"~S t 51 i.er no
r05 on'r~ledSed

3 ll1.a~o\·e eon 6:00 p, S:Ot ;;on (jl ide · Cl CdT 22 el'l " I ~L1g~t 5ih~~~,no
~S n "1., I~,n,1 a :v~. c,o~ €::;I3 p~ 8: ali :lI' (jl hie · CleaT 22 em " I ~~.ight si1v~~:'lno .I, fnr Qvewn 6:0J~n 8:0C ..., Gl ide · Cl edT 23 eM II I ~Light S~h~~llJ of San 1.1., ~ ." "oov~, t:OI.' , 6:00 pYI 8: OC' ;:", Gl ide · llNT 39j en " I ~~P!:Lbln ero ,

fl ~ nf, TC ease

'Use USGS 7.5' Quad "'!a? i~ ?OssiDle: otherw.:.se, .:.dent.:.{y reach as best you can
'See bac~side of this page for definitions
'Indicate whether Fahrenheit IF) or Cer.tigrade:Cl
''''~etric system in millimeters(mm! p:-e!:e:-Able: if no fisb caught, enter tlP'
'Indicate if Scales(Sl, T1ssue(T), 0:- Nor:elNJ; ro&l:lOVI .cal•• abovI lateral line; no mOre dl1m 1 cm'

of caudal(tail) fin ti'IUI removld at outlr margin: .11 backSide for further instruction.

Disposition of Sample(_) T~kQn, ~,~o~,~.~.~'~l'~'~l~'~'"'~" __



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

s>A'

DATE Apr! 1 26 I 1995

STREA:1 FISHED 'Ientura River

t'IlUr>l1::; flU, O.NJ..Y om;; UA'1'I" ANU Ulll::; AllUJ..I:>X YI:>X ~

STATION DATA STREAK DATA FISH DATA

Wdl
.

II11E IlA3ITAT W,\Tl::ll ="" SA....PL8 COMMENTS
LOCATIOX' START STOP TYF,,· IE/,jp. ' TI.lRB1DI1'Y' lZNGllr 1',\KEN'

7 ~'-Ie~'",lIe 0'0'1 :VU p"1' I ~:"'V PII' Gli<:e - C1Nr i':\cm S 2~~~t sil~Tr~ n~ flfest Pk . e on' reese

• lmr ~~"6~d. 6:00 Pl' 8:C{I .... Gl ide - Claar lli elll S IIr; bt sih r " flw,
li~;tlllp~~:,j_ 6:00 fir!' 8:0C ;lI1 Glide Clear " ~ S llriobt SlhTr~ ng til- eros lOll" re e se

Ie ~:,npB o~e 6:00 P1 8:0v :C1 &1 ide - Clear 23 ~ S Ilrl9~! sl~~fr. 1'0 flenp$IOn; re eased

" /1' • t'8;; 6: Oil po, ~:CO ::q Gl idp - ("ear lH trn S ~~~nn~i~~f~J~~~ filoH P ,

I

R:EPO~TlNG INDIVIlJUkL Surlev J, Capel:1

ADDRESS 121 Falom.res Avellut", \'entura. C,\ 93C03

(8<)5) 654-0l!S'

Dis.pos.ition of Sample(a) TaKe-r.: Cu,-atec witrl Jistrict Fhllerlts 81010gist (11. Cudenas)

'Use USGS 7,5' Quad t4ap if possible; :lther;,l.:.se, .:.dem:1!y reach as besc ~'cu can
'See baCKside of this page for defir.ltior.~

'Indicate whether Fahrenheit (F) O~ CeI'.tig.a::le leI
'Metric system in millimeters(m:n) preferable; it no ti.h caught, enter NF
~Indicate if Scales(S), Tissue{T), 0'= ~one~tl); re::lOVI scalls above l11torlll 1inl; no mo!:e than 1 c:n'

of ell-udalltail} tin tiS8U" relllOved at outel' 1I>arg10; ss. backside fol' furthel' instructions



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

RE?QRTING INDIVIDUAL__[ra<'Q~'~H".cCd'"P.'lll['"- __

ADDRESS EMirurrrentai Studit!~ Prt:-gra;r, UCSB, $.$. ';>31::16

STR:::tJ>l FrSHED '1E.'ntura Ri¥er

DATE ~Dril 26, Ig95

(8GS) 8~3-2963PHONE NO. ONLY OlfE DATE AND ONE ANGLER PER DATA SHEET

STAT!ON DATA STREAM DATA F!SH DATA

,"" TT~lE HABiTAT \~,\TER

""'"
SAMPLE COMMENTS

NO. LOCATIONl
STA.~T STOP T"iPE' ,8Mi'. ) TUR.EIOITyl LKtlGIIT' TAKEN'

t2 ir:1 ,e~~~n~ 6:30 prl 7:CO ;I~ Pool D9 fO Clear 26 em S 'rode~ ~yrsel ar.d
auca n' retaIned

Oisposi tion of Sample (6) Taken; _...I~Xot,,-e9 'l'Hh f:j Hriet. n ~~.ertes 1l1o.1J:lQisL-tK.._.Cdrdends 1

'Use USGS 7.5' Quae l'lap if possible; othe!"W:'se, ~dent:'fy reach as best you can
'See backside of this page for ciefi~itions
'Indicate whether Fahre,1heit (F) or CentigradelC)
'Metric system in millimeters(mm) pre:"erable; if no fisb caught, enter NF
'I~aicate it Scalas(S) , Tissue(T), O~ ~or.e(Ni; r~ove scales above lat~ral line; no more than 1 cm'

of c3.1,l<41 (tail) fin tissue relOOved a.t outer l:largin; see backside for further instructions



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

REPORTING INDIVIDUAL StanleJ J. C<ljJell i 5TREJ>1.1 FISHED ',entur<l lI.iv€1'"

ADDRESS 12i FalorrBl"es Avenue, \'el'ltura, CA ~3003 :}."TE Aprll 2B, 1995

(60SJ 654-0551I?llotlE NO. ;' ONLY ONE DATE AND ONE ANGLER PER DATA SHEET

STATION DATA STREAM DATA FISH DATA

TI~1E HI..BITt·:r ,~ATER SN~P)£SPO) 1Q'i'A!, COMMENTS
NO. LOCATION' START STO' TIP;;:' TE:~lP. ' TUR3IDITY' LENGHT' TAKEN'

" IITI belo~' 6:30 ~' 8;:lO pt1 Pool - CleM 27 011 r~ 1u."§rs~i_~ln erOded;
IfobJes Oi'! relused

--

Disposition of Sample(s) Takch' .'O"CC,···..",,",'-,",",·,""'- __

'Use USGS 1.S' Quad t·lap if possible; otherw_se, lder>t.ify Teach as beSt ~·cu ca:1
2See backsicie of this ?i!ge fOl:" cie:ir'.ltions
Jlnciicate ',d:ethe= Filr.=ent.eit (F) 0= Cer.tigra.1e lei
'Metric system in m!lll.meters(mm) prEfe~able; if no fish caught, enter UF
~Indicat .. , ScaI ... ~ ,TiS5ue(T), or None!tll; r .....ov.. sc.les above lateral liD... no 1II0r. than 1 Clll'

ot 'AudAlltAil) ..~ tissue removed at outer margin; See baCkside for further in.tructign.



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

REPORTIXG INDIVIDUAL__'",'"'"k~Ho·cC",."eCIICi,- __

ADDRESS En'.. jronn:Ent~l Studie, ?ro5ran, U($S, $.&. SJ10C

STRKAl~ r'ISIiED ~'entu"'a ::l:ivllr

DATE April 30, 1995

(805) 693-2568PHOXE :\0. ONLY ONE DATE AND ONE ANGLER PER DATA SHEET

STATION DATA STREAM DATA FISH DATA

SIl! TIME HAS liA':' W"'TE~ 'lOrA!. SAM?LE COMMENTS
NO. LOCATION' STAin STOP TYPE' TE:~P. ' TURIHt:J:TY' LEl':GHT' TAKEN"

1-1 -In Jel~;" ;<~, 6:00 POl 7:00 0'1 Pool f.!l F' Cleoir 36 CIT< 5 __~~ ~?r~f~t~r;~ed

I

,

Disposition of Sample(s) Taken: Curated with Cistriet Fi,herie\ Biologist (r,1. Cardenas)

lUse USGS 1.5' Quad Map if possible; otherw:se, idencify reach as test you can
'See backside of this page fo~ definitions
'Indicate whether Fahrenheit {P} O~ CentigradefCl
'Metric system in millimeters (m:nj preferable; if no fisb cal1ght, eoter NF
'Indicate if Scales{Sl, Tiss.:e(T), nr None (Ill ; remove scales above lateral lioe; no more than 1 cm'

of caud_lltail) fin tissue removed at outer margin; see backside for further instructions



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAO DATA REPORT

REPOR"i":NG INDIVIDUAL. SUnle:r .:, CaDe1l1

ADDRESS 127 Pale.ure; !<verJe, Ver,tura, CA n1Kl3

STR£Jl.N FISHED Ventun Ri-Ier

~ATE April JO. 1995

PH:)NE NO. (llOS) 654-0651 om:t om: OA.TE AND ONE ll:GLER PER DATA SHEET

STATtON DATA STREAM DATA FISH DATA

~: TUlE HA31TkT WATER wr,\l SN~PI_,E COIolMEN'TS
NO. LOCATIO:;' START STOP TYPE' TEHP, J TURillOITY' L:::NGHT' TAKEN'

15 mb~lll'" _" 6: 00 p;r 7:JO en POll 1 . Cledr l7f cm " eri\l~t s I l~er; no fi,
"

Disposition of Sa~ple{sJ 7aken' __J"'_'•••""I""'Cl"'.!k!.C" _

'Use USGS 7.S' Quad !'!ap if posslble; o>;herwue, ide:lcify reach as best you can
'See backside of this page for definitions
'Indicate whether Fahrenheit (F) :Jr Cent:'grade\CI
<Metric system in milli~eters{~mJ preferab~e; it no ti,h eaught, enter NY
'Indicate if Scales (S), 7issue tTl, or tlone un; relll.Ove "eale" above lateral linl!; no JIIOr8 tban 1 ='

of caudalftaill fig tiaaue removed at outet margin; aee backaide tor turthar ioatructioos



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAO DATA REPORT

~£PORTING rNC;V:CU~L,-,"c"c'·'CHC·~C,-Pe'c'c"' __

,~.DDRI:.sS ElI~irornent~l SWdje~ ProQrarr. VCS3, S.3. !i3'Q5

S:'R~""" l":SHEOUI""'"ltuc'o'LBBiiv"'"''-- _

C~TE_ ,lAY 1__lQJl;i.

j605J E93-2966 ON1.Y ONE DATE AND ONE ANGLER PER DATA SHEET

STATION DATA STREAM DATA "ISH DATA

51':>l TIME HASIT,\T WATER 'TU:'AL S;l,MPLI:: COMMENTS
:>0, LOCATIO,,' START S7C-;: TYPEI TE:4P. ' TIJRBIDITYl LE..'\GIIT' TAKIWI

" !'Ie 11 ho 1e: 1 6::10 pn 6::;0 p:r Pool 6l! F- S1inhtl turbi 21 crl N fish escaped

~~~\e, a"b...o"e",

I

I

D:.5posi t i;;'I, ~! 5'lmple i sJ Take:l: -'"",'-'-"'"o"e'"'"''-',,-,.,,," __
lise USGS 7.5' Ql;.ac. I-l'lP i~ pos.5ible: ott:e"""ise, id,mti~y !"each as beRt you can

ISoe baCKside 0: tt:i£ page te>r d"ti:"lttlo,",,,
):nd~cat~ :.thethe!" Far.!"er.t:eit (Fj 0:- CentiS!"ade(Cl
·Met.r~c syste" ir. :niIIimete:-IO[m:Jl) ?:-e~e!"abl(!; if no fish caught, ent.al:" NF
'l!1dlcat.c .:..f $calel/.(SI. Tissl.;,e\T), 0:- Nor.eW); ral:love scalall above. latlll:"al line; no ...,re than 1 em'

of ceudpl [t.ail) fin tissue removed at. outel:" ::Jargin; aee baekside fOI:" further in.tructions



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

OA:'E ,l'.lt 7, ;9~5

S7R~"4 F:SHED V.rtura Rlyer

PHONE;: NO. ONLY ON' OAT. AND ONE ANGLER PER DATA SHIET

STATION DATA STREAM DATA rISH DATA

SI'!I TWE HAB:7A7 ....·.:..TER TCT.'I\J, SAJolPLB COKHEtlTS
NO. LOCATIO:';' START STOP .Y]E' ,,,Hi'. ' TURIHDITY' l.F.N:::IlT' TAKEN"

" IJ·S . .l:;ll to 10:(0) 4" ~:oo P" Poe i •.d!.lt' 68 f· 119Mly lurbl t;; , ,~~~~ ... ny s,lte
l1rle

- -

REPORTIKO I~DIVIUJAL,-:'~"~'~'-"C·"C~.",".,",~,,- __

ADDRESS trvtronll!"lUiI Stl.l1l1as Pro~r.!f, LeSS, S.S. 93:05

(81JS) 893-2968

Dispes i t lOll ot San',ph (II Tai(e:1 :__C":...:'C'_"CP'C·C'CC'C··C·C"'- _

'Use USGS '7.5' Quad f\\ap it polullble; ot.~e"'... is!'c, leer.city reilcil 3.11 beflC you can
'See backside of thil page fcr defl~itions
'Indicate whether Fahrenheit 1f'1 or Centig:-aee(Cj
'~letric IIYltem in mill1metera(Il'Ir.l preferable; if no Ush cl.uqht. IIntllr NF
~lndlClIte if Sca1•• (S), Ti"'..L8\TI. or :';oneUi); remove scs1ea above lateral line; no IIIOre than 1 cm'

of caudal (taU) Un tiuue relllOved at outer ::aargin; see back' ide for further inat-ructions



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

RE PORTIKG IND IVIDUML,-'=""'C'k,-,II".~C.~,,,,,,,.',,i _

ADDRESS EI1'iirOnlTlEntal Studies PrograM, UCS6, S.I!. 93106

STRE:A:~ FISEED Ventura Rl"ier

DATE tiilJ la, 1995

(605J 893-2965PHO;"'E, NO. ONLY ONE: DATE: AND ONE ANGLER PER DATA SHEET

STATION DATA STREAM DATA PISH DATA

S~l
TIME l-'.ABIT"T W,;TE:R rot,," SAl~PLE COMMENTS

NO. LOCATION' START SlOP TYPE' TE:l-lP. ' TURBIDITY' LENGHT' TAKEN'

C "iiJDlj .,,f<' 6:0) pm i:OO :JIll Pool, 0\ j~ 6!1F c S1 ightly turbi '" II
"

I,.

,

Disposi>::ion of sample Is I Taken '_--'"0'--,':':',,"'",'--""",,"'-- _
'Use USGS 7.5' Quad Map if poss::..b:e; c:.hendse, idencify reach d3 :Jest. you can
'See backside of this page for definitions
'Indicate ..hether Fahrenheit IF) Dr Cent::..gradelC)
'Metric system in millirneter9(m~) preferable; if no fi9h caught, enter NF
'Ind.l.cate if Scales(SJ, 7issue/Tl. Dr !lone Ii'll ; remove 9cale9 above lateral line; nO more than 1 cm'

of caudalltaill fin tissue removed at outer lr.argin; gee back9ide for further instructions



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

REPORTING INDIVIDUAL,__"""'"k"H".'C~.".,e,""~ __ STREAl·l FISHED Verltura Rj ~er

AD8RESS Envlrontrent.<Jl Studies Progran. ursa. S,6, 93106 Dil.TE Hay 12. 19'1~

)PHONE NO. "0"" I BS3- 295B ONLY ONE DATE AND ONE ANGLER PER DATA SHEET

STATION DATA STREAM DATA FISH DATA

S~~ l!i~E rtABITAT W.\TER 'IOl'N, $A.'.\P!.E COMMENTS
NO. LOCATION' START sro, TYPE' TEMP. ' TURBIDITY' LENGHT' TAKE1\"

17 'n~l~bg~e p, 6:00 prr 7:00 pm Gi ide 6e,o Sligntlyturbi 33 em S. T ~iih~br~~htb~ilv~~"
releilsea

. .. f • I IT' .~CC""""··":':':···'"H'.:J.j~'~'~'~"::.:'~f~j~'~I,~.~,j,.e,'.."""'.',9.""'-'('"",C·.·.,,·.'""."'2)D~spcs~t~on 0 ~cmp~e s a~~n,

-Dse USGS 7.5' Quad Miip ~f poss~ble; c~henilse, identify .each;;ls be<it yo'.! can
'See backside of this page for def~nlticns

'Indicate \oIhether Fahrenhe~t IFI or Cenu..grad<,:(C)
'Metric system in ~illioeterslmm) preferable; if no fish caught, enter NF
'Indicate if ScaleslSJ, Tissue!'I'), Dr Ncne(Nl; relllOve scales above lateral lioe; no more than 1 em'

of caudalltaill fin tissue removed at outer margin; see backside for further instructions



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

REPORTH1G lNDI V1CU....:..,_C',.Oc<'-!'C·_,,,.""'"'l'C' _

ADDII.£53 Enyiro"ne~hl Studie~ PrograJr, IJCS!t, S.5. 9.3:05

S,REAM F:SHED ',Ie?~"ra RhO,.

DATE ','a" 15. 1:195
•

ONLY mfE DATE AND ONE ANGLER PER DATA SHE};T(8C5) 893-2%3.

STATION DATA STREAM DATA PISH DATA

""
7:ME HASIT!,T WA:'ER 'l'C'I'A.! SA:'~PLE COMMENTS

NO. J..ocAT1CW S.""R7 Sf:)? TYPE' T£7.:P •• "'JR.BIOITY~ LENGIIT' T"'tEN', on! 11.1 ll! ::.~" 6:00 PT 7:3C pn Pool,.r1il1l 6:1 r· Clear' W~ t~r c~ I(,linn f 11 eel
C" c HF ,

"It; fl a
:-0 l iye OaJ, dill;' to recenl he,"',.

-

PHQX£ SO

D~spasiti~n of S3mple(s) Takc~ •• c',__;_·-c"'C'e'"'cct!.,<.",- _

Use usr,s 7.~' Ol.:ac ~l<l? it possible; Q!:her~'1se, identi:y reac!: as best yO-J can
'See backside o~ l!:i.!l page fe-r oefi"it:io""
'Indicate whet!:e!" F.al~!"en:t:eit IF) or Centig!"ade(Ci
'Metnc syste"ll ir. millimeters{mm} t>re!et".abl~; if no fish caught. enter NF
'Ind1.cate if Scales (Sj. Tis5\;e iT). 0:- XOl'.e (K); remove scales above latoral line; no II'IOre than 1 crn'

of caudal! tail) fin tissue r"':DOved at outer margin; see backsidll for further inetructionll



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

REPOR:TING INDIVICUAL S\.d1Iey;. C.~elli

ADDR.ESS 121 Faln1""'s AyerJI, 'ill,yr., cs. ~j(lJJ

STfiE.\'''I I'ISHEO ~entJr. River

DATE 'Jay :6, :9'5

(SO!i) 654-CtblPllom,; flO. ONLY ONE DATE AND ONII ANGLER PER DATA SHEET

STATZON DATA STREAK DATA PZSH DATA

.,,, TIM? HAatT1o.T WATER TIrlJ SII.:,o;PLf, OOKME.",.S
NO. LOCATION' STAAT STOP TYPE' T:::~:P. I Th"RB IDITY' RNGHT' TAKEN'

• n-;g: ~ Glide Clear 23tcrr S.T _~9ht Sll~~r, nD18
~~VL CD

.

" • bolO \II II :CO fWI" :;lllle - Clear 23 en , lri~?t sl'~ r.no rl~...
rell!4Scll

Oilpolit:ion Qf San-,phlll T"lten: :::ur.teJ .. ·t~ (listric! cisherfes Btoloqj,~ (rtCat1~nBS)

'Use USGS ;.5' Quad Map if ponible; ott.e:-...ise, ider.t~(y reach as best you clIn
'See bacitside of t::tu page fC'r det1:11tionl
'Ind1ca-;;e whet:her rahre:l:teit: IF! or C8ntlgr<1.ce(:::)
'Met:ric 8Y8t.8111 10 r.l.ilh~ter.lrr.rr.l prefer<1.::'1e; if no fi.h c.ught, ent.r NI'
sIndicllt.e if Seal•• lSI, Tillue ITI, er 1-;o:leen; r ....ov••c.l•• above l.ter.l Ilnl; no IIIOre t~n 1 cc·

ot c.ydalluill CiA tillUI rllllOvld .t outer ~in; ... backside tor furth.r in.tnlctlon.



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

REPORTIXG UOrnDOl.:".c'""C'C'-,'c·-,C""C'"" ", _ S7REN-t ;:-:SIIEO Ventura River

ADDRESS---.£r:... i rOIl1lI!..'l1 a I St.ilclip't rr'lC C'''' ~ LC53. £. 8._.'.i31J(j CA'iE Doll' J6 J 995

(805) 893-2':158PEONE SO. OULY ONE DATE AND ONE ANGLER PER DATA SHEET

STATION DATA STREAM DATA FISH DATA

~~, TIME F.ABITAT Wf,TER 'l'(YJ'A!:. Sh'lPLE COMMENTS
SO. LOCATIO;.;:' STAAT STep TIPF-' Te::~? • TURBIO!TY' LE"CHT' TAKEN'

20 ~c~flueJ'\~~ ~6;J.O pr 7:Cli :n G!ide to':! F· C1 ea r 21 em "
fl sn es(:a~

~~r Antcni

01 spo51 t i on oi SlIrrple 18, Ta_~en :--,·l~',-",~,.~p""',.,,-,,,,!!'~'~" _
'Use USG:; 1.5' Quad ~!ap if pess:..b:e; ether....ule, lde"~lfy reaen as beat. you can
'See ~ck~iac of this page for def:..ntt.10ns
'Ir.ciicate whether Fahre"!lelt IF, or Cen::igradelC)
':~etric system i:'l rnill irr.eters {rr.m) prefera;,le; it no fish caught, enter NY
'Indicate if Scales (s), Tissue iT). or :.IO:1e tX); relflOve .<::alea above larer... l line; no mora thao 1 C:Ill'

of <::audal(t.ill tin ti~sue removed at outer margin; !lee ba<::k.ide ~or tu.rthar instructions



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

R~?ORTrNG rNDIVlOUAL_'C'"'"'"""'~""P"c"c"c- __
ADDRess ElIvir(l'llIfmt,' Stu<Uu Pro~".'I1, J:SH, S.S. 93J16

STREAM FISHED Ventllr. ~IYlll'

;JATE Ma.f 11, 1995

IPHONE NO. ICon/ OlO~·('Oll ONLY ON'!: DATE ANtI OHE AHOLER PER DATA SWEET

STATION DATA STRaAH DATA 1'1811 DATA

111>:£ HAB:TAT 'h'ATER FORK SAMPLE -,
NO. ux..,tl/ Cil START "'0' 7Yi'E' 7EHi'. ' Tu;m Il:) I'IT' :'1'113117' 'l'AKbN'

0 ~el!. W~~~ 6:00 P" I :30 11"I Po" r~~fJ,. Mr"' Slightly turol ,or ,

--

Oi8po.~e~on of Samplels] Ta~en,__-,'"'-,"~'"PC'"'"'cc""""" _

'Use USGS 7,5' OUad Map if poss~b_e; ot~~~ise, i~~~tify reach as belL you can
~See backside of this page for deflnltlon.
lrndlcat:e whet:her Pahrenhe:..t IFl or Centigrade (e)
'Metric syst:eJ:l in ll\iL.. i_tersIQlllI prefenllole; if no B.h c.ught, ental' N'
"Ind~c..te if Scalell!SJ, 7~lIsueI7l. or /;c;1;)\Nj; rt:DOva .cala. obov. tataral 11na; no IlIOra than 1 c-""

of caydalltaill tip ti••ue r.-oved at outer =argin; ••e back.id. for fureher in.tructiona



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

REPOR1'ING IN:::1V!OO.... t..,_"'.,.!"k2H",--'''"p"."I"'~I _

ADDi<E5.;~lrcm'lltf' Stlloi'5 Prggrll, UCSB. S.s. G;jIC6

S7REAM FISHED VenturI! Rlyer

DATE May 18, 1995

(tiCS) 8!)3·1968I'Jo.u.\t; ;\U. ONLY ONK DATE AND ONE ANGLER PER DATA SHEET

STATION DATA STREAK DATA "UH DATA

~nl In.;;: r..AEilTAT Wl.7ER ""A' 8A,,04PLI;: COMH""'":-':0. 1.oc"TIO:>;' STAAT ,TO> TYPE' Te;4P, ' 11JRBIDITY' L~GHT' TIIKI~N~

21 I,
,

e:oo " : 30 i1r'l Pool 61 r~ Clear 26 rM1 " rhl'l l!'~t"_1ed

22
Y :',0 E:OO It \:30 ~rl Pool bi r- Cleu 28 cm S,l ~~t ~f),~e,r,cst. Pl 01v

"
_ 'I I ll~,o: !:ou ., :JJ .11 Hlol 6i r- Ii_Qst i Cledr 26 C~I S escopt;.:l

" .! ,d t/VII ';j:OU n : JJ ., '00' 67 f- Clur (6 Cli I, I tIt! eSCilpl!'CI
-

2> l' .!J.nve 9:00 .,.. : 3J •• ,.. fl r" Clear ?~ ell • .... d, •
'"

1_.II_'ld!:!~·'L. !l:30 .IT :4') II R'Hlp £] r· I 'I "
Ish tlt!~~t silvAr,ost Pk •

I'rO~10'" re eased

1)~"POlJjU:::1' ~~<;.II,;,lellll T"1te:'1: l."rate4 ",tt~ Dlstr!ct rfs,erlu Bjologist (M_J:4ltC.l:IIO'o,JI _

ulle USGS 1.',' O..dd f·:/IP i! pt>lI81ble; Ct~end8e. ide::ti!y rflach al beat you can
'See backsidll Qt Ll.i" ~ge !C,f defi:1ltic:".
':nd~c&lO whetn.t!" Fa}-.ren!".. lt If- or Centigrade'::)
'Metr~c .y.te~ ir. ~llli~ter.(mm' preferable; if no filh ellught, ent.r NT
'Jrnhcate ~r Scal•• ':SJ. Tisstoe':T), or !'or.eiKI; reaove .ealll' above latorai Un., no .are than 1 cr:'

of cAud,ll"ill Cio till'u, removed at outer ~r9in; lIell bllck.i4, tor Curther tnlltruotions
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SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

REPORTIXG [N~JVICUk~.-!"~'!'c'~.cfC!'.""'U'i' __ S7Rli:AA ?:SHlm Vrntura Slyer

AOOkl::SS ~ ..tdroml!nt,l 5'11<111$ P!"09r'll, J:>B, $.3, 931126 CAT!_ Kay 2CL 19f.iS

'80s) ~';·19611PHONE NO. • '. ONLY ONE DATE AND on ANGLER PER. DATA SHEET

STATION DATA STREAK DATA P:ISH DATA

"m TJK.E HABI7A~ WATEIt 'fOI',\L SAMPLE COKHBtn'S
'0. LO~' .sTART "roP 7YPB' ':",,:-11) .• TURa:O:7Y' LI::NGIrr* TAKEN'
31 ~~~," e O'~ 9:00 an 9::~'1 1'001 61 F" (INr n Oil , I".. .1m'32 TTl eow 9: OJ all1 9: 15 am Pool fish ('sur"'11Roble t~l 61 f" Cll!at 24 011 1

33 ~til~~~
9:(10 '11 9:H a~ Pool 67 f~ ( I •• r I9 C~t S. T rl~k nrig'ltsllver:no

" A~~]Drl ' 9.:5.", 9:3(' '" Pool f1 f' (Il'~' ,,<> 1 111 cr(l~'~ r~le~se
'On e\C/l--

" t~~
~:,~ all ,,:"'... ,II< 00' (,} I ~ (Iedr 1& till • Fish rscPHd

3(. • PO : J.J 11 ,:~~ ,,.. ~O:ll tl F· C1Nr 2S~ " rho esc.;,ed
•

" 'tgt l I'~ 9:JO 4'r

~
Pool fI F" (I'M 2'

" '" : ~ " : fr- .", tl r" c Ir.lf" 1.1 c, ',1 lfohl' bd t lih,r;no

" . '" . : ' IT ,'~ '00' ti> f' :lrH l~ Cl " l"lsh "'C"~~

"
, eo. : =11 • .J: ..l 'J' 00' tlJ f' (lear 26apbl , FiSh escorl ell

DlspoElitlO:'l cf s""'p:'elal ";'akl!n, Cvnrd wHh (IHriu fjsr~rtes lliolcc;g!Y. Cardecas)

':"se L.:oGS 7.5' Cuad Maop ,f PODliIlble; other...;..e, ld,-nt fy reach as beDt you can
"Se.e oacj(side ct ::".:.8 page (r,r dllr.n~tJ.an.

'Ir.c.icate ·...hether fillhren~el:: 1:1 or Cent~grado!IC!

'~~t~ic .y~tem in rellli~~ter.I~1 preCerab:e; it no ti.h c.ught. eater NY
'Indicate i~ 5calellliSJ, TiIllJl-.JeIT:. or tlcfle\Nl; rell>Clv••cel•• above lateral l1ne; no _re than 1 em'

of caud.llt.ill fin ti ••u. r.llIOvlo'd lot out.r IUrgrin; ••• back.id. for further 1natT=tiono;



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

RE?CR~~N3 IND1VIDUALc 'e"e'"'ce'c·cC"'t',.,c'c1'- __

I.DORESS Eo~ir:lnllefta1 SVJdles ?rog~dn, ~CS5, S.Il. 93106

STREiIJ.j FISHED Venturi! River

DATE Hay 20. 19!i5"

(605) 893·Z968 ONLY ONE DATE AND ONB ANGLBR PER DATA SIlBBT

STlIT:IOH DATA STREA.."1 DATA F:ISH DATA

sr:,j TIME tl~ITAT WATEK ""'''' SA¥.PLE COMMENTS
NO. LOCA:-:ON START sro, TYP;::' T;:;HP. I TUKiH::ltTY' LENOIIT' TAKEN'

41~~ (l'jj 10:00 alii 10: 30 a. Pocl ,,, Clear 2J~ " Fish (>~upl1d

- e 0" lO:OC iln42 lI.ot>le~ c~iv 10:30 iI Pool 58 F' (I ear 23 effl N FI h

"
rrl1l!~ below iU:l1U an 10:30 I~ Pool S8 F' Clear 231 em 5.T Fish bright ~i1ver;'lO

~4
,n .~ "":~~ an (C:30 11 ;>001 58 F- (lear 20m "

1n cr~s lOn; rc, ('hell. • 0

" I!~~~~Po r;. 10:J~ a", 1O.;n • 66 r Clear ,. " rish (>~Clped

" '¥,'Yd ba 'eo' 10:30 I'll J4:45 all" '001 S8 F· Clear 25m N fish escapedRpb es

" ~J~iW~sb51~' lU:3U i!Il ;O:~5 a/l' Feol Eo f- Clea r 25 em I. •.1

4!;~S!~W lJ:~~ all' ,1::'-; an Pool 1:8 F- Char 26 em 5.T ~ S,he~~!~~'ts tl'~~J~;~~o" r t>wn>'l'a ...

:JiSpclll:_on 01 Sample{s) Taker:: (urated wit'! Distric:t =Isheries l!lolflqist (M, Cardenasl

'Use USCS 7.5' OUa::l ;tap if pol>sible; otherwise, identify teach a9 best '1°1.: can
'See buCKs~de of this page !o~ cefir:itioT:s
lr:-Jdica::.e whether !"ahrE'cnheu [PI o~ Cer;tigradelCJ
'''etrie sys::.er.l in I"illil;leters{rrm) p:::-eferable; if no fisb caught. ente>: HI'
>Indicate If Sca:esISI, 7:"ssuel1'J. O' N::melNI; >:emova IIcales above Illt.,>:al lin.; no mor. t.han 1 em'

of caudal (taill Uc tissue ru:aoved at Ollter margin; see backside to>: furt.ber in"t.>:uctions



SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA STEELHEAD DATA REPORT

REPORTING !NDIViDUAL,-",""k~'C'c'e'"E""'C"C' ___

ADDRESS En~lron'rent~l Studies Prografl, UCS6, S.I!. :J31C6

SIREA!': F!SIIE~ Ventura Rt~er

PAT::: ~a'/ 27, 1995

'SOs) 893-2956PHONE NO. Om,Y ONE DATE AND ONE ANGLER PER DATA SHEET

STATION DATA STREAM DATA FISH DATA

S,," TINE flhBITAT WATER =AL SA1-;PLE COMMENTS
NO. LOCATION' START STOP TYPE' TEMP. I TIJRDIOfIY' LENGItT' TAKEN'

" h~ below ep~Jnl0:00arl 10:15 air Pool 68 f* (1 eH 25 ern , Fish escd>oed

" l~ ~[i0tlaC n . , , ,." I ."" ,e<O 24 ern " Fish csed~e:luna''., Shllll Hole 11:00 am 11:30 aI", Poo' t8 f* Clear .:'6 (;:11 " Fish Il$ca~~d

" Shell Hole 11:30 an 11:~~ 811 Poo' t8 f- (1 ed,. 1J~ " Fish escdpe<l

Disposition of Sample(sl 'aken:_-"t1.'_"••ro"-'e'"'-',,.,,!'.' _
'Use USGS 1.5' Quad ~ap if possible; otherw:se, lden~ify reach as be~t you can
'See bacKside of this page for definitlons
'Indicate whether Fahrenheit (F) or CentigradelC)
'Metric syste~ in milli~eter$(~) preferable; if no fish caught, eater UP
'Indicate if Scales(SJ. Ti5Bl,;eiT). or tloneUl); remove scales above lateral line; no more than 1 cm'

of caudalltail) fin ,i••ue rlUlloved 8t outer ClIrgin; see backsid.. for further instructions



HABITAT nu,

POOLo, A ulu~:ly TJiet place ~~ a .trea~. which variee in si~e and location within
the .treaw. ~rrent 'lelocity ia ~aually low with little to no turbulence.
S~b.tr.te ~I variable.

GLIDE, A wide. un~[orm channel botto~.

lacking pronounced turbulence.
gr~vel, an~ ~and.

Plow wlth low to moderate velocities,
SUbltrate usually consists of cobble.

'UN- Swiftly flowing reachea with little surface agitaLion and no ~ajor flow
oblltructio:l. Often appear. a. Cleoded rHeles. Typical substrate consists
o[ gril'lel, cobble, and bouldere.

RIPPLE, Sh.llow to steep reaches with awiftly flowing, turbulenL water. do:ninillted
with cobble or boulders

$UnSTRATI SIZ!

Sand, Lell thIn ~ ",m (0.01 inch) in di"meter.

Gravel '2 to U ~.. 10.08 to ~., Incheal ill dillll'lcter.

Cobbh/lbl.bble, €~ to 2!l6 ""' 12.5 to 10 Incl:eel in dla.Jl\Ctcr.

Boulder, GreatOlr thilln 2'56 "'" 110 lncha.l in d~oilll'cter.

TURPIDITY

Clear, If bott~ II dlltinctly lIeen thro~9h 4 or ~re reet o[ wa~er_

Slightly turbid, If Dottom ~. indiltinet at frOM t to 4 feet .

Turbid. • ~ botto~ ia vllible only .t l.s. than I foot.

AD».Ill2lt1rr.L..-USSUE SN1PLI~.s.

Remove ti ••~e .a~pl. [rom live flah only and on fish with low fir. erosion

use only 2nA label ad ldate. atltion no., IDd Individual'e ~aat name) bag/vial per
fiab tissue .ample; ice la~le i~4adi.tely; (ree~e a. eoon as po••ible

Clean tool after each ••~ple to preve~t c~oaa'con:a~in~tion



Appendix G

Ventura River SteelhcadfTroul Scale Vouchers



COLLECTION DATE: Apri 26, 1995
OCATION: Ventura River, • mOle belm'o'

- Fostet' ark Bridge

3P~CIES. O. myk,~~

I"OTAL LEN TH: 26 em (lD i

SAMP : Lat al sc les

COLLECTCR~ Mark H. Cape
'PECr 1'1 r NO: ]2

Call lION DATE: ~IY 2 199

LOCATION: V n ura Ri v) il bo
h Road Sri rig

P 'C IS: o. /Tlfl/~l.

TOTAL NCTH: (1 i )
JlNPL£: a'i ca1es

CVLL CTOR: Mark JI. C P 11;
SPEe 1MEr' NO: 7

COll eTION DA : ~ay 8~ 995

LOCATI~~: Yen uraRiver 3/4 mile a ave
Foster Park Sri ga

SPEer i::S: J. m/jrUt.,5

TOTAL LENGTH: 26 em ( i

SANPlE i. La tera1 sea 1es.

COlLECTOR: Mark H. Cape 1;

SPECU1E' NO: 2t:

COLL~CTION DATE: ~ay 2 19 5

LOCATIOh: Ventura Rivers 3/ mi e bel
Robles Diversion Dam

SP CI&~: v my~¢

TOTAL L[NETH~ 9 em (7i On)
SAMPLE: Lateral cales

COLLECTOR- Mar H. Capel .

SPECU1E' NO: 3

G LLEC' 'TOI DATE: April 30 1995

C.r·ON: e tura River J .; mile ~e1ow
Fo er'Park rloge

P- I S; O. LtWo

r T L NGTH: 36 m (141 in)

APE: a er 1 s al s

C LLEC OR: a H. Capell,
PE: r'lE r NO: 4

Ol Ecl UN 0 TE: My 18~ 19Y5
LOC ION: Ventu a ~iverj JOO yards b 1 w

.ty ot" 1l. nt'ur Fos te r Pd, rk
:"u·fd. lJ1Vd'SIOn

F~CI . myh q

IOTAL tNGJH: ,8 em (1~ On)

5, PLE: La ra cales
coe £C : '·1 t H. Ca e1 1
SPEC ti NO' 22

COLLEC 10 DATE: May l~i 995
L CATI 0 '. entura River. ~ mi 1e alJove

, con 1uence o'f San Anton i 0 Creek

SPE f5; 0.. Ijf~UJ

T TAL LENGTH: 26 em ( 0 in)

:M-tPLE: Lateral scales

o LEe-OR: ~ark H. Capell i

,JPEC 0: 28

OL tCTI ATE: May 20, 1995
DeATIOr.: Ventura R1ve.r, i mile belo,",

Robles Di~ersion Dam
S~ELI 5: ~, rnY~4

OTA LE GTH: 23 em (9 in)
SN PLE' lateral scaleS

COlL CTOR: Mark H. Cape 11
SPECI El 0: 33



· COLU.CTION DATE: Kay 20, 1995

LOCATICII: Ventur& River. 1nl:lcd1ltely
belON apron c· Robles Jlversion...

SPECIES: O.~
roTAl. LtKGTH: 23! Gl 191 tn)

S~PLE: Lateral scales

C(LLECU'R: Kark Ii. capelli

SPECIMEN KO: 4~

COLLLCTIOM DATE: April 26. 1996

LOCATI(),: Venblrl River, llllledilitely
below C1ty of Ventura foster
P.rk Surface Diversion

~PECIES: O. ~Y~4
TOTAL LENGTH: 211 on (81 in)
SAlWLE: Lateral $clIles

COLLECT('R: Stanley J. Capelli

SPEW'EIt "'0: 7

COLLECTION DATE: f.prll 26, 1995

LOCATlIJIt: Ventura River. 3/4 .f1e .lbove
foster Par~ Bddge

SPECIES: C. lII"WJ
TOTAl. LEJ«iTH: 24 CJlI (9i 1n)
SNti'lE: Lilural scalM

COllECTOR: Sunley J, C.pelli

SPEClHO' NO: !i

COLLtCTICIt DATE: April 26. 1595

LOCATIOh: Ventura River. 3/4 .Ile .bove
I\()ster P.rk Brlli};e

SPECIES: O. ~J~
roTAl.. LEHGTI1: 25i ClII (JOlin)

SPliPLE: Lateral scales

COlLECTOR: Stanley J. Capilli

SPECIMEtl NO: 11

COUEt-TiON OATE: 144y 20, 1995

LOCAilO'l': Ventura R1ver, iJmJediately
below ipron 0 Robles Oivel"$lon...

~PECIES: O. ~.~
T"lTAL LEHGlll: 26 CIII (10 In)

SAMPlE: Lner~l scales

COLLECTor: Mark H. capelli

SPECI'"EM 1\0: 40

COLLtCTIO!i DATE: AprtT 26. 1995

LOCATI~: Vent~r.l River. 3/4 ~ile above
fosttr Plrt. Bridge

SPECIES: O. .,~
TOTAL LENGTH: 2U em (81 in)

SA~PL[: Lateral sClles

COCLECTOP; Stanley J. Capelli
SPfCIMEH 00: Ii

eOUCTION DATE; April 26. 1995

LOCATI~: Ventllra River. G/4 .lle above
foster Park Brl6ge

SPECI=:S: l.. "'Y.k....
TOTAL lENGTI1: 23 QI (9 In)

SA~~: ~aterll scalts

toLLECTO~: Stanlty J. Capel11
SPE!:i)t.;1 SO: 10

COlltCTlON DATE: Moly 16, 1995

LOCATICltI: Vent..r. River, 3/4 Mile above
confl~ence of Sin Antonio Cret

SPECiES: O. iollfM.44

TOTAL LENGTH: 2J! em (9! in)
SAM?LE: Literal scales

COlLEvTOR: Stanley J. Capell1
SPECtME1" No: 18



COLLeCTION DATE; Hay 16, 1995
LOCATIOh: Ventura River, 1 mlle above

confluence of San Antonio Creek
SPECIL.i: Ii. ",~1U.;4

TOTAL LENGTH: 23 em (9 in)

SAMPLE: later~l scales

COLLECTO~; Stahley J. Capelli
::;PECIM(t1 flO: 19



AppendIx H

Ventura River mtONA Haplotypes and Nuclear Microsatellite loci
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